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Press Release 

Only a Foolish, Cowardly Traitor can plead to the United Nations and the So-
Called International Community for the Liberation of Kashmir 

On 21st September 2016, Pakistan's Prime Minister, Nawaz Sharif, whilst addressing the General 
Assembly of United Nations yet again pleaded to the United Nations, the current world powers and the 
so-called international community for the resolution of the Kashmir dispute. Hizb ut Tahrir Wilayah 
Pakistan strongly condemns the policy of the Raheel-Nawaz regime, which places false hopes on 
the Kuffar for the liberation of Kashmir from oppressive occupation of Hindu State, instead of preparing 
Muslims of Pakistan and their armed forces.  

How can any sane, conscience and aware person, who knows the character of the United Nations, 
current world powers and so-called international community, plead for help for the liberation of Kashmir 
from them? Is this not the same United Nations and international community who patiently and silently 
has watched the slaughter of hundreds of thousands of Muslims from Kashmir to Palestine, Afghanistan 
to Syria and Myanmar to the Central African Republic? Is this not the same United Nations and 
international community who actively worked for the separation of East Timor from Indonesia and South 
Sudan from the rest of the Sudan and ensured that it happen? Is this not the same United Nations and 
international community who over seventy years has not only given a free hand to the Hindu State and 
Jewish Entity to commit brutal oppression and massacre of the Muslims of Kashmir and Palestine, but 
also provides excuses so that they do not even have to condemn their atrocities? 

If a common Muslim knows the reality of the United Nations, current world powers and international 
community and that they will never act to resolve the issues of Muslims justly, forcing the oppressors to 
end their oppression, then how can the current rulers of Muslims be ignorant of this reality? If anyone 
asks for help from United Nations, the current world powers and the international community for the 
liberation of Kashmir from the Hindu state occupation and oppression, after knowing their character, 
then he is simply a fool, coward and a traitor. A sincere ruler, politician, statesman and leader will never 
place the Ummah on the wrong course. Therefore who ever urges the United Nations, current world 
powers and international community to act for the liberation of Kashmir, is not sincere with the Muslims 
of Pakistan and Kashmir. Moreover, he is providing an ample opportunity for the Hindu State to 
consolidate its occupation and continue oppression against the Muslims of occupied Kashmir. 

The Muslims of Kashmir has once again made it clear that their future is tied with Pakistan. In every 
demonstration we see that they raise Pakistani flags, they wrap their martyrs in Pakistan flag and they 
shout a slogan similar to the slogan of the independence movement of Pakistan, which is: what is the 
meaning of Independence, لا الہ الا اللہ  . So has the time not arrived for the armed forces of Pakistan to 
mobilize and liberate occupied Kashmir and its Muslims from the Hindu state, as these noble Muslims 
have made clear to the whole world that they want to become part of Pakistan? However, the current 
traitor leadership will never order armed forces of Pakistan for Jihad-e-Kashmir. This can only happen 
under a rightly guided Khaleefah who will unify all Muslim Lands and their armies within a single state, 
Khilafah on the Method of Prophethood, and under the banner of RasulAllah (saaw), will announce Jihad 
for the liberation of Kashmir.    

أنَّهُمْ قأوْمٌ لاَّ يأفْقأهُونأ ﴿ نأ ٱللَّهِ ذٰلِكأ بِأ هْبأةً فىِ صُدُورِهِمْ م ِ أنتمُْ أأشأدُّ رأ  ﴾لَأ

“Verily, you (believers) are more awful as a fear in their breasts than Allah. That is because 
they are a people who comprehend not (the Majesty and Power of Allah)” [Al-Hashr: 13] 
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